
Apex 
Petroleum 

Corporation

Campbell Oil 
Company

Colonial Oil 
Industries, Inc.

Fannon 
Petroleum 

Services, Inc.

Global Montell 
Group Corp.

James River 
Solutions

Mansfield Oil 
Company of 

Gainesville, Inc.

Petroleum 
Traders 

Corporation

Pinnacle 
Petroleum, Inc.

Saratoga Rack 
Marketing LLC

Sunoco, LLC

 Regular Unleaded BALTIMORE - 
Net Price Differential per Gallon 

(0.0100)$            (0.0516)$            0.7400$             No Bid (0.0098)$            OPIS (0.0555)$            No Bid No Bid (0.0201)$            (0.0562)$            

 Regular Unleaded FAIRFAX - Net 
Price Differential per Gallon 

(0.0100)$            (0.0549)$            0.7400$             No Bid 0.0252$             OPIS (0.0526)$            No Bid No Bid (0.0101)$            (0.0450)$            

 Regular Unleaded Truck 
Transport WILL CALL ZONE 1 - 
Net Price Differential per Gallon 

 $             0.0500  $           (0.0301)  $             0.7400  $             0.0887  $             0.0941  $           (0.0175) (0.0281)$             $           (0.0212)  No Bid  $             0.0453 (0.0210)$            

 Regular Unleaded Truck 
Transport AUTOMATIC DELIVERY 
ZONE 1 - Net Price Differential 
per Gallon 

 $             0.0600  $           (0.0201)  $             0.7500  $             0.0887  $             0.0941  $             0.0201 (0.0114)$             No Bid  No Bid  $             0.0453 (0.0200)$            

 Mid-Grade Unleaded Truck 
Transport WILL CALL Zone 1 - 
Net Price Differential per Gallon 

 No Bid  $           (0.0868)  $             0.7500  $             0.0887  $             0.0949  $             0.1150 No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid (0.0100)$            

 Mid-Grade Unleaded Truck 
Transport AUTOMATIC DELIVERY 
Zone 1 - Net Price Differential 
per Gallon 

 No Bid  $           (0.0868)  $             0.7500  $             0.0887  $             0.0949  $             0.1201 No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid (0.0100)$            

 Premium Unleaded Truck 
Transport WILL CALL Zone 1 - 
Net Price Differential per Gallon 

No Bid (0.2682)$            0.7500$             0.0887$             0.0574$             0.0400$             No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid (0.2700)$            

 Premium Unleaded Truck 
Transport AUTOMATIC DELIVERY 
Zone 1 - Net Price Differential 
per Gallon 

No Bid (0.2682)$            0.7500$             0.0887$             0.0574$             0.0500$             No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid (0.3000)$            

 Regular Unleaded Truck 
Transport WILL CALL ZONE 2 - 
Net Price Differential per Gallon 

 $             0.0455  $           (0.0235)  $             0.7500  $             0.0987  $             0.0895  $             0.0050  $           (0.0044)  No Bid  $             0.0496  $             0.0442  $           (0.0231)

 Regular Unleaded Truck 
Transport AUTOMATIC DELIVERY 
ZONE 2 - Net Price Differential 
per Gallon 

 $             0.0545  $           (0.0235)  $             0.7500  $             0.0987  $             0.0895  $             0.0065  $             0.0184  No Bid  $             0.0497  $             0.0442  $           (0.0200)

IFB #1162627
Online Bidding for Cooperative Purchase of Unleaded Gasoline (Reverse Auction)

Montgomery County, MD 
Final Net Price Differentials ‐ April 16, 2024

SECTION ONE ‐ F.O.B. TERMINAL POINT PICKUP

SECTION TWO ‐ TRUCK TRANSPORT DELIVERY ‐ ZONE 1 ‐ Metropolitan Virginia                                                   

SECTION TWO ‐ TRUCK TRANSPORT DELIVERY ‐ ZONE 2 ‐ Montgomery County, MD                                                
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IFB #1162627
Online Bidding for Cooperative Purchase of Unleaded Gasoline (Reverse Auction)

Montgomery County, MD 
Final Net Price Differentials ‐ April 16, 2024

SECTION ONE ‐ F.O.B. TERMINAL POINT PICKUP
 Mid-Grade Unleaded Truck 
Transport WILL CALL Zone 2 - 
Net Price Differential per Gallon 

 No Bid  $           (0.0934)  $             0.7500  $             0.9870  $             0.0903  $             0.1050  No Bid  No Bid  $             0.9999  $             0.0452  $           (0.0925)

 Mid-Grade Unleaded Truck 
Transport AUTOMATIC DELIVERY 
Zone 2 - Net Price Differential 
per Gallon 

 No Bid  $           (0.0934)  $             0.7500  $             0.9870  $             0.0903  $             0.1065  No Bid  No Bid  $             0.9999  $             0.0452  $           (0.0910)

 Premium Unleaded Truck 
Transport WILL CALL Zone 2 - 
Net Price Differential per Gallon 

0.0545$             (0.2573)$            0.7500$             0.9870$             0.0528$             0.1050$              No Bid No Bid 0.9999$             No Bid  $           (0.0500)

 Premium Unleaded Truck 
Transport AUTOMATIC DELIVERY 
Zone 2 - Net Price Differential 
per Gallon 

0.0545$             (0.2573)$            0.7500$             0.9870$             0.0528$             0.1065$              No Bid No Bid 0.9999$             No Bid  $           (0.0500)

 Regular Unleaded Truck 
Transport WILL CALL ZONE 3 - 
Net Price Differential per Gallon 

 $             0.0578  $           (0.0275)  $             0.7500  $             0.0987  $             0.1194  $           (0.0175)  $           (0.0154)  $             0.0019  No Bid  $             0.0332  $           (0.0276)

 Regular Unleaded Truck 
Transport AUTOMATIC DELIVERY 
ZONE 3 - Net Price Differential 
per Gallon 

 $             0.0578  $           (0.0261)  $             0.7500  $             0.0987  $             0.1194  $             0.0100  $           (0.0110)  No Bid  No Bid  $             0.0332  $           (0.0262)

 Mid-Grade Unleaded Truck 
Transport WILL CALL Zone 3 - 
Net Price Differential per Gallon 

 No Bid  $           (0.0778)  $             0.7500  $             0.9870  $             0.1202  $             0.1025  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  $           (0.0500)

 Mid-Grade Unleaded Truck 
Transport AUTOMATIC DELIVERY 
Zone 3 - Net Price Differential 
per Gallon 

 No Bid  $           (0.0778)  $             0.7500  $             0.9870  $             0.1202  $             0.1165  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  $           (0.0500)

 Premium Unleaded Truck 
Transport WILL CALL Zone 3 - 
Net Price Differential per Gallon 

0.0580$             (0.2592)$            0.7500$             0.9870$             0.0827$             0.1025$              No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid  $           (0.1000)

 Premium Unleaded Truck 
Transport AUTOMATIC DELIVERY 
Zone 3 - Net Price Differential 
per Gallon 

 $             0.0580  $           (0.2592) 0.7500$             0.9870$             0.0827$             0.1165$              No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid  $           (0.1000)

 SECTION TWO ‐ TRUCK TRANSPORT DELIVERY ‐ ZONE 3 ‐ Prince George's County, MD                                               

SECTION TWO ‐ TRUCK TRANSPORT DELIVERY ‐ ZONE 4 ‐ Washington, DC                                                       
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IFB #1162627
Online Bidding for Cooperative Purchase of Unleaded Gasoline (Reverse Auction)

Montgomery County, MD 
Final Net Price Differentials ‐ April 16, 2024

SECTION ONE ‐ F.O.B. TERMINAL POINT PICKUP
 Regular Unleaded Truck 
Transport WILL CALL ZONE 4 - 
Net Price Differential per Gallon 

 $             0.0350 (0.0211)$             $             0.7500  $             0.0787  $             0.0817  $           (0.0100) (0.0180)$             $           (0.0101)  No Bid  No Bid (0.0200)$            

 Regular Unleaded Truck 
Transport AUTOMATIC DELIVERY 
ZONE 4 - Net Price Differential 
per Gallon 

 $             0.0350 (0.0211)$             $             0.7500  $             0.0787  $             0.0817  $             0.0070 (0.0141)$             No Bid  No Bid  No Bid (0.0200)$            

 Mid-Grade Unleaded Truck 
Transport WILL CALL Zone 4 - 
Net Price Differential per Gallon 

 No Bid (0.0803)$             $             0.7500  $             0.0787  $             0.0825  $             0.1025 No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid (0.0500)$            

 Mid-Grade Unleaded Truck 
Transport AUTOMATIC DELIVERY 
Zone 4 - Net Price Differential 
per Gallon 

 No Bid (0.0803)$             $             0.7500  $             0.0787  $             0.0825  $             0.1240 No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid (0.0500)$            

 Premium Unleaded Truck 
Transport WILL CALL Zone 4 - 
Net Price Differential per Gallon 

0.0350$             (0.2617)$            0.7500$             0.0787$             0.0450$             0.1025$             No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid (0.1000)$            

 Premium Unleaded Truck 
Transport AUTOMATIC DELIVERY 
Zone 4 - Net Price Differential 
per Gallon 

0.0435$             (0.2617)$            0.7500$             0.0787$             0.0450$             0.1240$             No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid (0.1001)$            

 Regular Unleaded Truck 
Transport WILL CALL ZONE 5 - 
Net Price Differential per Gallon 

 $             0.0580  $           (0.0201)  $             0.7500  No Bid  $             0.0925  $             0.0025  $           (0.0291)  $           (0.0272)  No Bid  No Bid  $           (0.0300)

 Regular Unleaded Truck 
Transport AUTOMATIC DELIVERY 
ZONE 5 - Net Price Differential 
per Gallon 

 $             0.0780  $           (0.0118)  $             0.7500  No Bid  $             0.0925  $             0.0100  $           (0.0224)  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  $           (0.0250)

 Mid-Grade Unleaded Truck 
Transport WILL CALL Zone 5 - 
Net Price Differential per Gallon 

 No Bid  $           (0.0702)  $             0.7500  No Bid  $             0.0933  $             0.1050  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  $           (0.0700)

 Mid-Grade Unleaded Truck 
Transport AUTOMATIC DELIVERY 
Zone 5 - Net Price Differential 
per Gallon 

 No Bid  $           (0.0702)  $             0.7500  No Bid  $             0.0933  $             0.1240  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  $           (0.0650)

 Premium Unleaded Truck 
Transport WILL CALL Zone 5 - 
Net Price Differential per Gallon 

0.0950$             (0.2325)$            0.7500$             No Bid 0.0558$             0.1050$              No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid  $           (0.2400)

SECTION TWO ‐ TRUCK TRANSPORT DELIVERY ‐ ZONE 5 ‐ Anne Arundel County, MD                                                
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IFB #1162627
Online Bidding for Cooperative Purchase of Unleaded Gasoline (Reverse Auction)

Montgomery County, MD 
Final Net Price Differentials ‐ April 16, 2024

SECTION ONE ‐ F.O.B. TERMINAL POINT PICKUP Premium Unleaded Truck 
Transport AUTOMATIC DELIVERY 
Zone 5 - Net Price Differential 
per Gallon 

 $             0.1200 (0.2341)$            0.7500$             No Bid 0.0558$             0.1240$              No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid  $           (0.2400)

 Regular Unleaded Truck 
Transport WILL CALL ZONE 6 - 
Net Price Differential per Gallon 

No Bid  $           (0.0019)  $             0.7500  No Bid  $             0.2682  $             0.0125  $           (0.0104)  $             0.0063  No Bid  No Bid  $           (0.0105)

 Regular Unleaded Truck 
Transport AUTOMATIC DELIVERY 
ZONE 6 - Net Price Differential 
per Gallon 

No Bid  $           (0.0019)  $             0.7500  No Bid  $             0.2682  $             0.0350  $           (0.0078)  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  $           (0.0105)

 Mid-Grade Unleaded Truck 
Transport WILL CALL Zone 6 - 
Net Price Differential per Gallon 

No Bid  $           (0.0619)  $             0.7500  No Bid  $             0.2690  $             0.1125  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  $           (0.0600)

 Mid-Grade Unleaded Truck 
Transport AUTOMATIC DELIVERY 
Zone 6 - Net Price Differential 
per Gallon 

No Bid  $           (0.0619)  $             0.7500  No Bid  $             0.2690  $             0.1350  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  $           (0.0550)

 Premium Unleaded Truck 
Transport WILL CALL Zone 6 - 
Net Price Differential per Gallon 

No Bid (0.2308)$            0.7500$             No Bid 0.2315$             0.1125$              No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid  $           (0.1000)

 Premium Unleaded Truck 
Transport AUTOMATIC DELIVERY 
Zone 6 - Net Price Differential 
per Gallon 

No Bid (0.2308)$            0.7500$             No Bid 0.2315$             0.1350$              No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid  $           (0.0500)

 Regular Unleaded Truck 
Transport WILL CALL ZONE 7 - 
Net Price Differential per Gallon 

 $             0.0901  $           (0.0101)  $             0.7500  No Bid  $             0.1286  $             0.0075  $           (0.0154)  $           (0.0120)  No Bid  $             0.0264  $           (0.0175)

 Regular Unleaded Truck 
Transport AUTOMATIC DELIVERY 
ZONE 7 - Net Price Differential 
per Gallon 

 $             0.0901  $           (0.0018)  $             0.7500  No Bid  $             0.1286  $             0.0350  $             0.0126  No Bid  No Bid  $             0.0289  $           (0.0050)

 Mid-Grade Unleaded Truck 
Transport WILL CALL Zone 7 - 
Net Price Differential per Gallon 

 No Bid  $           (0.0596)  $             0.7500  No Bid  $             0.1294  $             0.1075  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  $           (0.0500)

SECTION TWO ‐ TRUCK TRANSPORT DELIVERY ‐ ZONE 7 ‐ Howard County, MD                                                    

SECTION TWO ‐ TRUCK TRANSPORT DELIVERY ‐ ZONE 6 ‐ Carroll County, MD
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Marketing LLC
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IFB #1162627
Online Bidding for Cooperative Purchase of Unleaded Gasoline (Reverse Auction)

Montgomery County, MD 
Final Net Price Differentials ‐ April 16, 2024

SECTION ONE ‐ F.O.B. TERMINAL POINT PICKUP Mid-Grade Unleaded Truck 
Transport AUTOMATIC DELIVERY 
Zone 7 - Net Price Differential 
per Gallon 

 No Bid  $           (0.0596)  $             0.7500  No Bid  $             0.1294  $             0.1045  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  $           (0.0500)

 Premium Unleaded Truck 
Transport WILL CALL Zone 7 - 
Net Price Differential per Gallon 

0.1700$             (0.2410)$            0.7500$             No Bid 0.0919$             0.1075$              No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid  $           (0.1000)

 Premium Unleaded Truck 
Transport AUTOMATIC DELIVERY 
Zone 7 - Net Price Differential 
per Gallon 

0.1900$             (0.2410)$            0.7500$             No Bid 0.0919$             0.1045$              No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid  $           (0.1000)

 Regular Unleaded Truck 
Transport WILL CALL ZONE 8 - 
Net Price Differential per Gallon 

 No Bid  $           (0.0025)  $             0.7500  No Bid  $             0.1167  $             0.0025  $             0.0178  $             0.0252  No Bid  No Bid  $           (0.0050)

 Regular Unleaded Truck 
Transport AUTOMATIC DELIVERY 
ZONE 8 - Net Price Differential 
per Gallon 

 No Bid  $           (0.0025)  $             0.7500  No Bid  $             0.1167  $             0.0300  $             0.0305  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  $           (0.0040)

 Mid-Grade Unleaded Truck 
Transport WILL CALL Zone 8 - 
Net Price Differential per Gallon 

 No Bid  $           (0.0554)  $             0.7500  No Bid  $             0.1175  $             0.1025  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  $           (0.0500)

 Mid-Grade Unleaded Truck 
Transport AUTOMATIC DELIVERY 
Zone 8 - Net Price Differential 
per Gallon 

 No Bid  $           (0.0554)  $             0.7500  No Bid  $             0.1175  $             0.1030  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  $           (0.0500)

 Premium Unleaded Truck 
Transport WILL CALL Zone 8 - 
Net Price Differential per Gallon 

No Bid (0.2368)$            0.7500$             No Bid 0.0800$             0.1025$              No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid  $           (0.1000)

 Premium Unleaded Truck 
Transport AUTOMATIC DELIVERY 
Zone 8 - Net Price Differential 
per Gallon 

No Bid (0.2368)$            0.7500$             No Bid 0.0800$             0.1030$              No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid  $           (0.1000)

 Regular Unleaded Tank Wagon 
WILL CALL ZONE 1 - Net Price 
Differential per Gallon 

 $             0.0750 No Bid  $             0.7500  $             0.0713  $             0.4952 0.0700$             0.1987$             No Bid No Bid No Bid 0.3500$             

SECTION THREE ‐ TANK WAGON DELIVERY ‐ ZONE 1 ‐ Metropolitan Virginia                                                      

SECTION TWO ‐ TRUCK TRANSPORT DELIVERY ‐ ZONE 8 ‐ Frederick County, MD                                                    
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Petroleum, Inc.
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IFB #1162627
Online Bidding for Cooperative Purchase of Unleaded Gasoline (Reverse Auction)

Montgomery County, MD 
Final Net Price Differentials ‐ April 16, 2024

SECTION ONE ‐ F.O.B. TERMINAL POINT PICKUP
 Regular Unleaded Tank Wagon 
AUTOMATIC DELIVERY ZONE 1 - 
Net Price Differential per Gallon 

 $             0.0750 No Bid  $             0.7500  $             0.0983  $             0.4952 0.0749$             0.1987$             No Bid No Bid No Bid 0.3500$             

 Mid-Grade Unleaded Tank 
Wagon WILL CALL ZONE 1 - Net 
Price Differential per Gallon 

No Bid No Bid  $             0.7500 0.1873$              $             0.4460 0.2200$             No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 0.3500$             

 Mid-Grade Unleaded Tank 
Wagon AUTOMATIC DELIVERY 
ZONE 1 - Net Price Differential 
per Gallon 

No Bid No Bid  $             0.7500 0.1873$              $             0.4460 0.2200$             No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 0.3500$             

 Premium Unleaded Tank Wagon 
WILL CALL ZONE 1 - Net Price 
Differential per Gallon 

0.0900$             No Bid 0.7500$             0.0613$             0.4085$             0.0550$             0.0564$             No Bid No Bid No Bid 0.3500$             

 Premium Unleaded Tank Wagon 
AUTOMATIC DELIVERY ZONE 1 - 
Net Price Differential per Gallon 

0.0900$             No Bid 0.7500$             0.0713$             0.4085$             0.0550$             0.0564$             No Bid No Bid No Bid 0.3500$             

 Regular Unleaded Tank Wagon 
WILL CALL ZONE 2 - Net Price 
Differential per Gallon 

0.0999$             No Bid  $             0.7500  $             0.2873  $             0.4447 0.1025$              $             0.2427 No Bid  $             0.1165 No Bid  $             1.0000 

 Regular Unleaded Tank Wagon 
AUTOMATIC DELIVERY ZONE 2 - 
Net Price Differential per Gallon 

0.0999$             No Bid  $             0.7500  $             0.2873  $             0.4447 0.1080$              $             0.2427 No Bid  $             0.8679 No Bid  $             1.0000 

 Mid-Grade Unleaded Tank 
Wagon WILL CALL ZONE 2 - Net 
Price Differential per Gallon 

No Bid No Bid  $             0.7500  $             0.2373  $             0.3955 0.4000$              $             0.1569 No Bid 0.1515$             No Bid  $             1.0000 

 Mid-Grade Unleaded Tank 
Wagon AUTOMATIC DELIVERY 
ZONE 2 - Net Price Differential 
per Gallon 

No Bid No Bid  $             0.7500  $             0.2373  $             0.3955 0.4000$              $             0.1569 No Bid 0.1515$             No Bid  $             1.0000 

 Premium Unleaded Tank Wagon 
WILL CALL ZONE 2 - Net Price 
Differential per Gallon 

0.3000$             No Bid 0.7500$             0.2773$             0.3580$             0.5000$             No Bid No Bid 0.9999$             No Bid  $             1.0000 

 Premium Unleaded Tank Wagon 
AUTOMATIC DELIVERY ZONE 2 - 
Net Price Differential per Gallon 

0.3000$             No Bid 0.7500$             0.2773$             0.3580$             0.5000$             No Bid No Bid 0.9999$             No Bid  $             1.0000 

SECTION THREE ‐ TANK WAGON DELIVERY ‐ ZONE 2 ‐ Montgomery County, MD                                                    
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Petroleum, Inc.
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IFB #1162627
Online Bidding for Cooperative Purchase of Unleaded Gasoline (Reverse Auction)

Montgomery County, MD 
Final Net Price Differentials ‐ April 16, 2024

SECTION ONE ‐ F.O.B. TERMINAL POINT PICKUP

 Regular Unleaded Tank Wagon 
WILL CALL ZONE 3 - Net Price 
Differential per Gallon 

0.0700$             No Bid  $             0.7500  $             0.2873  $             0.7947 0.0740$              $             0.1697 No Bid No Bid No Bid  $             1.0000 

 Regular Unleaded Tank Wagon 
AUTOMATIC DELIVERY ZONE 3 - 
Net Price Differential per Gallon 

0.0700$             No Bid  $             0.7500  $             0.3870  $             0.7947 0.0749$              $             0.1697 No Bid No Bid No Bid  $             1.0000 

 Mid-Grade Unleaded Tank 
Wagon WILL CALL ZONE 3 - Net 
Price Differential per Gallon 

No Bid No Bid  $             0.7500 0.2843$              $             0.8455 0.3000$             No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid  $             1.0000 

 Mid-Grade Unleaded Tank 
Wagon AUTOMATIC DELIVERY 
ZONE 3 - Net Price Differential 
per Gallon 

No Bid No Bid  $             0.7500 0.2983$              $             0.8455 0.3000$             No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid  $             1.0000 

 Premium Unleaded Tank Wagon 
WILL CALL ZONE 3 - Net Price 
Differential per Gallon 

0.3500$             No Bid 0.7500$             0.2963$             0.8580$             0.4000$             No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid  $             1.0000 

 Premium Unleaded Tank Wagon 
AUTOMATIC DELIVERY ZONE 3 - 
Net Price Differential per Gallon 

0.3500$             No Bid 0.7500$             0.2993$             0.8580$             0.4000$             No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid  $             1.0000 

 Regular Unleaded Tank Wagon 
WILL CALL ZONE 4 - Net Price 
Differential per Gallon 

0.0600$             No Bid  $             0.7500  $             0.0618  $             1.4452 0.0800$             0.1496$             No Bid No Bid No Bid 1.0000$             

 Regular Unleaded Tank Wagon 
AUTOMATIC DELIVERY ZONE 4 - 
Net Price Differential per Gallon 

0.0700$             No Bid  $             0.7500  $             0.0732  $             1.4452 0.0900$             0.1496$             No Bid No Bid No Bid 1.0000$             

 Mid-Grade Unleaded Tank 
Wagon WILL CALL ZONE 4 - Net 
Price Differential per Gallon 

No Bid No Bid  $             0.7500 0.2870$              $             1.4960 0.3000$             No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 1.0000$             

 Mid-Grade Unleaded Tank 
Wagon AUTOMATIC DELIVERY 
ZONE 4 - Net Price Differential 
per Gallon 

No Bid No Bid  $             0.7500 0.2870$              $             1.4960 0.3000$             No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 1.0000$             

SECTION THREE ‐ TANK WAGON DELIVERY ‐ ZONE 3 ‐ Prince George's County, MD                                                 

SECTION THREE ‐ TANK WAGON DELIVERY ‐ ZONE 4 ‐ Washington, DC                                                           
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Apex 
Petroleum 

Corporation

Campbell Oil 
Company

Colonial Oil 
Industries, Inc.

Fannon 
Petroleum 

Services, Inc.

Global Montell 
Group Corp.

James River 
Solutions

Mansfield Oil 
Company of 

Gainesville, Inc.

Petroleum 
Traders 

Corporation

Pinnacle 
Petroleum, Inc.

Saratoga Rack 
Marketing LLC

Sunoco, LLC

IFB #1162627
Online Bidding for Cooperative Purchase of Unleaded Gasoline (Reverse Auction)

Montgomery County, MD 
Final Net Price Differentials ‐ April 16, 2024

SECTION ONE ‐ F.O.B. TERMINAL POINT PICKUP
 Premium Unleaded Tank Wagon 
WILL CALL ZONE 4 - Net Price 
Differential per Gallon 

0.2095$             No Bid 0.7500$             0.1873$             1.5085$             0.4000$             No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 1.0000$             

 Premium Unleaded Tank Wagon 
AUTOMATIC DELIVERY ZONE 4 - 
Net Price Differential per Gallon 

0.2095$             No Bid 0.7500$             0.1973$             1.5085$             0.4000$             No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 1.0000$             

 Regular Unleaded Tank Wagon 
WILL CALL ZONE 5 - Net Price 
Differential per Gallon 

 $             0.1450 No Bid  $             0.7500 No Bid  $             0.3052 0.1400$             No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid  $             1.0000 

 Regular Unleaded Tank Wagon 
AUTOMATIC DELIVERY ZONE 5 - 
Net Price Differential per Gallon 

 $             0.1650 No Bid  $             0.7500 No Bid  $             0.3052 0.1300$             No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid  $             1.0000 

 Mid-Grade Unleaded Tank 
Wagon WILL CALL ZONE 5 - Net 
Price Differential per Gallon 

No Bid No Bid  $             0.7500 No Bid  $             0.4060 0.4000$             No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid  $             1.0000 

 Mid-Grade Unleaded Tank 
Wagon AUTOMATIC DELIVERY 
ZONE 5 - Net Price Differential 
per Gallon 

No Bid No Bid  $             0.7500 No Bid  $             0.4060 0.4000$             No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid  $             1.0000 

 Premium Unleaded Tank Wagon 
WILL CALL ZONE 5 - Net Price 
Differential per Gallon 

0.3500$             No Bid 0.7500$             No Bid 0.4685$             0.5000$             No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid  $             1.0000 

 Premium Unleaded Tank Wagon 
AUTOMATIC DELIVERY ZONE 5 - 
Net Price Differential per Gallon 

0.3500$             No Bid 0.7500$             No Bid 0.4685$             0.5000$             No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid  $             1.0000 

 Regular Unleaded Tank Wagon 
WILL CALL ZONE 6 - Net Price 
Differential per Gallon 

No Bid No Bid  $             0.7500 No Bid 0.4452$             0.3800$             No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid  $             1.0000 

 Regular Unleaded Tank Wagon 
AUTOMATIC DELIVERY ZONE 6 - 
Net Price Differential per Gallon 

No Bid No Bid  $             0.7500 No Bid 0.4452$             0.3400$             No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid  $             1.0000 

SECTION THREE ‐ TANK WAGON DELIVERY ‐ ZONE 6 ‐ Carroll County, MD                                                        

SECTION THREE ‐ TANK WAGON DELIVERY ‐ ZONE 5 ‐ Anne Arundel County, MD                                                   
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Apex 
Petroleum 

Corporation

Campbell Oil 
Company

Colonial Oil 
Industries, Inc.

Fannon 
Petroleum 

Services, Inc.

Global Montell 
Group Corp.

James River 
Solutions

Mansfield Oil 
Company of 

Gainesville, Inc.

Petroleum 
Traders 

Corporation

Pinnacle 
Petroleum, Inc.

Saratoga Rack 
Marketing LLC

Sunoco, LLC

IFB #1162627
Online Bidding for Cooperative Purchase of Unleaded Gasoline (Reverse Auction)

Montgomery County, MD 
Final Net Price Differentials ‐ April 16, 2024

SECTION ONE ‐ F.O.B. TERMINAL POINT PICKUP
 Mid-Grade Unleaded Tank 
Wagon WILL CALL ZONE 6 - Net 
Price Differential per Gallon 

No Bid No Bid  $             0.7500 No Bid 0.4460$             0.4000$             No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid  $             1.0000 

 Mid-Grade Unleaded Tank 
Wagon AUTOMATIC DELIVERY 
ZONE 6 - Net Price Differential 
per Gallon 

No Bid No Bid  $             0.7500 No Bid 0.4460$             0.4000$             No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid  $             1.0000 

 Premium Unleaded Tank Wagon 
WILL CALL ZONE 6 - Net Price 
Differential per Gallon 

No Bid No Bid 0.7500$             No Bid 0.4085$             0.5000$             No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid  $             1.0000 

 Premium Unleaded Tank Wagon 
AUTOMATIC DELIVERY ZONE 6 - 
Net Price Differential per Gallon 

No Bid No Bid 0.7500$             No Bid 0.4085$             0.5000$             No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid  $             1.0000 

 Regular Unleaded Tank Wagon 
WILL CALL ZONE 7 - Net Price 
Differential per Gallon 

0.1188$             No Bid  $             0.7500 No Bid  $             0.4447 0.1190$              $             0.1657 No Bid No Bid No Bid  $             1.0000 

 Regular Unleaded Tank Wagon 
AUTOMATIC DELIVERY ZONE 7 - 
Net Price Differential per Gallon 

0.1188$             No Bid  $             0.7500 No Bid  $             0.4447 0.1190$              $             0.1657 No Bid No Bid No Bid  $             1.0000 

 Mid-Grade Unleaded Tank 
Wagon WILL CALL ZONE 7 - Net 
Price Differential per Gallon 

No Bid No Bid 0.7500$             No Bid 0.5455$             0.3000$             No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid  $             1.0000 

 Mid-Grade Unleaded Tank 
Wagon AUTOMATIC DELIVERY 
ZONE 7 - Net Price Differential 
per Gallon 

No Bid No Bid 0.7500$             No Bid 0.5455$             0.3000$             No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid  $             1.0000 

 Premium Unleaded Tank Wagon 
WILL CALL ZONE 7 - Net Price 
Differential per Gallon 

0.3500$             No Bid 0.7500$             No Bid 0.4580$             0.4000$             No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid  $             1.0000 

 Premium Unleaded Tank Wagon 
AUTOMATIC DELIVERY ZONE 7 - 
Net Price Differential per Gallon 

0.3500$             No Bid 0.7500$             No Bid 0.4580$             0.4000$             No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid  $             1.0000 

SECTION THREE ‐ TANK WAGON DELIVERY ‐ ZONE 8 ‐ Frederick County, MD                                                    

SECTION THREE ‐ TANK WAGON DELIVERY ‐ ZONE 7 ‐ Howard County, MD                                                       
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Apex 
Petroleum 

Corporation

Campbell Oil 
Company

Colonial Oil 
Industries, Inc.

Fannon 
Petroleum 

Services, Inc.

Global Montell 
Group Corp.

James River 
Solutions

Mansfield Oil 
Company of 

Gainesville, Inc.

Petroleum 
Traders 

Corporation

Pinnacle 
Petroleum, Inc.

Saratoga Rack 
Marketing LLC

Sunoco, LLC

IFB #1162627
Online Bidding for Cooperative Purchase of Unleaded Gasoline (Reverse Auction)

Montgomery County, MD 
Final Net Price Differentials ‐ April 16, 2024

SECTION ONE ‐ F.O.B. TERMINAL POINT PICKUP
 Regular Unleaded Tank Wagon 
WILL CALL ZONE 8 - Net Price 
Differential per Gallon 

No Bid No Bid 0.7500$             No Bid 0.5452$             0.2000$             0.2994$             No Bid No Bid No Bid 1.0000$             

 Regular Unleaded Tank Wagon 
AUTOMATIC DELIVERY ZONE 8 - 
Net Price Differential per Gallon 

No Bid No Bid 0.7500$             No Bid 0.5452$             0.2000$             0.2994$             No Bid No Bid No Bid 1.0000$             

 Mid-Grade Unleaded Tank 
Wagon WILL CALL ZONE 8 - Net 
Price Differential per Gallon 

No Bid No Bid 0.7500$             No Bid 0.5960$             0.3000$             No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 1.0000$             

 Mid-Grade Unleaded Tank 
Wagon AUTOMATIC DELIVERY 
ZONE 8 - Net Price Differential 
per Gallon 

No Bid No Bid 0.7500$             No Bid 0.5960$             0.3000$             No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 1.0000$             

 Premium Unleaded Tank Wagon 
WILL CALL ZONE 8 - Net Price 
Differential per Gallon 

No Bid No Bid 0.7500$             No Bid 0.5085$             0.4000$             No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 1.0000$             

 Premium Unleaded Tank Wagon 
AUTOMATIC DELIVERY ZONE 8 - 
Net Price Differential per Gallon 

No Bid No Bid 0.7500$             No Bid 0.5085$             0.4000$             No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 1.0000$             
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